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MEET THE ALPINE A110 BY OBVIOUS AT ART PARIS 2022 
A MODERN AND CONTEMPORARY ART EVENT

PARIS, 13.04.2022, 12:51 Time

USPA NEWS - The Alpine A110 Sastruga was unveiled on April 06, at the Grand Palais Éphémère and was be on display through
Sunday 10 April 2022. Alpine and the Obvious Art Collective was presenting the Fruit of their Artistic Collaboration, an "Art Car"
exploring the Creative Potential Of Artificial Intelligence (AI) and Algorithms by encouraging Dialogue between Technology and
Emotions. This Collaboration is Part of Alpine's Ongoing Commitment to the Arts, which takes Today a New Step Forward. 

The Alpine A110 Sastruga was unveiled on April 06, at the Grand Palais Éphémère and was be on display through Sunday 10 April
2022. Alpine and the Obvious Art Collective was presenting the Fruit of their Artistic Collaboration, an "Art Car" exploring the Creative
Potential Of Artificial Intelligence (AI) and Algorithms by encouraging Dialogue between Technology and Emotions. This Collaboration
is Part of Alpine's Ongoing Commitment to the Arts, which takes Today a New Step Forward.

By taking part in Art Paris 2022, a Modern and Contemporary Art Event, together with Obvious, Alpine is pursuing its Artistic
Commitment by exhibiting a Piece there for the Second Year Running. A110 Sastruga, an Original Work focusing on Technological
and Scientific Innovation within The Artistic Creation. 

Alpine has built its Legend with Technical Innovation and Automotive Excellence at the Service of Performance and Emotion. Obvious
took Inspiration from the Brand's Legendary Sporting Heritage to invent and create a Unique Piece materializing an Imaginary Race, a
Synthesis of all the Race Tracks Alpine has distinguished itself on. On the Body of the Alpine Brand's Iconic A110, there is an
Imaginary Circuit generated thanks to Artificial Intelligence. Its Style draws Inspiration from the Sastrugi Phenomenon when Snow
eroded by the Wind leave Geometric Undulations on the Ground. This Phenomenon echoes Alpine’s DNA and is the Creative Basis for
this Project. On the Back of the A110 is a Mathematical Formula, the Artists' Signature, which symbolises the Algorithm with which the
Collective worked to generate the Imaginary Alpine Track. 

This Exceptional Model is the Fruit of Several Months of Collaboration between Alpine and Obvious, bridging the Gap between
Heritage and Modernity and questioning Society's Relationship with New Technologies. Through the Creation of the Imaginary Circuit,
the Oeuvre uses the Capabilities of Machine Learning, which consists of allowing Computers to "Learn" from Data, and GANs, a Class
of Unsupervised Learning Algorithms. The Artists drew their Inspiration from the Circuits that have marked the A-Arrowed Brand's
History from Le Mans to Paul Ricard, Pedralbes, Pescara, Montjuïc, Monsanto, Magny-Cours, Long Beach, Losail and Kyalami, using
Familiar Elements to make it Realistic: Pitlane, Acceleration, braking and Overtaking Zones to create this Track. The Originality also
lies in a Multi-Direction Junction allowing the Driver to choose its Favorite One. This Imaginary Circuit is an Opportunity to project the
Car into a Futuristic Universe with Multiple Opportunities. 

Obvious succeeded to capture the DNA of our Brand to create an Original and Unique Piece Of Art highlighting our Firm Outlook on
the Future. Obvious and Alpine share the same Ambition: to use Technological Innovation to reinvent ourselves and explore an Ever-
Expanding Field of Possibilities. Through this Collaboration, we are proud to contribute to the Emergence of a New Form of Creation
and be associated with these Visionary Artists." Laurent Rossi, Alpine - CEO

"This Piece is the Result of a Long Creative Process in which we sought to imagine a Unique Object that communicates Technology
and sporting Savoir-Faire, drawing on the Heritage of this Historic Brand. Alpine has given us a Great Deal of Creative Freedom, and
this Achievement demonstrates their Desire to conquer New Frontiers." Collectif Obvious 

Art Paris, the Leading Modern And Contemporary Art Fair

Buoyed by the Success of its September 2021 Edition, which inaugurated the Grand Palais Éphémère on the Champ-de-Mars and
attracted a Record 72,746 Visitors, Art Paris was returning this Spring from 7 to 10 April 2022 with a High-Flying List of 130 Galleries
from more than Twenty Countries. The Alpine stand (D16) was presenting the Different Stages of the Creative Process and the
Dialogue between Alpine and Obvious leading to the Work presented on the Forecourt of the Grand Palais Éphémère. 



Founded in 1955 by Jean Rédélé, Alpine has asserted itself over the years with its French-Style Sports cars. In 2018, the Brand
presented the New A110, a Sports Car that is true to Alpine’s Timeless Principles of Compactness, Lightness, Agility and Driving
Pleasure. In 2021, the Alpine Business Unit was created, to become the Dedicated Brand for the Innovative, Authentic and Exclusive
Sports Cars of the Renault Group, benefiting from the Heritage and Know-How of its Historic Dieppe Factory and the Engineering
Expertise of the Alpine Racing and Alpine Cars Teams.

Obvious is a French Collective of Artists and Researchers who use Artificial Intelligence Algorithms to create Art. Their work was
highlighted in 2018 with the Sale of their Painting "Edmond de Belamy", the first of its kind, at Christie's NY. They sit on the
Crossroads of Classical Art and Recent Technologies. They subsequently exhibit in the Largest Museums in the World. Pioneers of
Digital Art, they are one of the first French Artists to have created NFTs in 2018, and in 2021 with the Kamel Mennour Gallery.
Through its Work and Collaborations, Obvious aims to explore Algorithmic Creativity and bring the Tools developed in the Research to
Creators in All Industries to initiate the Next Visual and Artistic Revolution.
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Source: Official Presentation on April 06, 2022 @ Art Paris Modern And Contemporary Art Fair - The Grand Palais Éphémère on the
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